FRESH PRODUCE and EGGS 2024-2026
RFQ #24-164
JULY 18, 2024

NUTRITION SERVICES
BUDGET $1,000,000
PURCHASE AS NEEDED

RICHMOND COUNTY SCHOOL SYSTEM
FRESH PRODUCE & EGGS RFQ#24-164

Leo's Produce Inc.
1151 5th Street; Augusta, GA 30901

Royal Food Service
3720 Zip Industrial Blvd.; Atlanta, GA 30354

Item Description Vendor MARKUP/(MARKDOWN) Est. Estimated Total MARKUP/(MARKDOWN) Est. Estimated Total
FIXED FEE to FIXED FEE to

# Pack AVERAGE MARKET PRICE Usage | Markup/(Markdown) Fees AVERAGE MARKET PRICE Usage Markup/(Markdown) Fees
Category: PRODUCE AND FRESH EGGS
FRUIT
7134500 |APPLES, GOLDEN 125CT $0.90 1,000 | $ 900.00 $2.50 1,000 | $ 2,500.00
7135405 |APPLES, HONEYCRISP 125CT $0.90 1,000 | $ 900.00 $2.50 1,000 | $ 2,500.00
7134350 |APPLES, OPAL 70 CT NO BID 800 $2.50 800 [ $ 2,000.00
713425 |APPLES, PINK LADY 125CT $0.90 800 | $ 720.00 $2.50 800 [ $ 2,000.00
713455 |APPLES, GALA 125CT $0.90 800 | $ 720.00 $2.50 800 [ $ 2,000.00
7134400 |APPLES, RED DELICIOUS 125CT $0.90 2,000 | $ 1,800.00 $2.50 2,000 | $ 5,000.00
7134300 |APPLES, GRANNY SMITH 125CT $0.90 2,000 | $ 1,800.00 $2.50 2,000 | $ 5,000.00
7194440 |BLACKBERRIES 12 PINTS $0.90 500 | $ 450.00 $2.50 500 | $ 1,250.00
7154900 |BLUEBERRIES 12 PINTS $0.90 500 | $ 450.00 $2.50 500 | $ 1,250.00
7154900 |PLUOT, DINO EGG 135CT NO BID 700 | $ - $2.50 700 | $ 1,750.00
7154950 |BANANAS, SCHOOL #2 COLOR GREEN GREEN 40# $0.90 300 | $ 270.00 $2.50 300 | $ 750.00
7154975 |BANANAS, SCHOOL #3 COLOR GREEN TURNING YELLOW 40# $0.90 300 | $ 270.00 $2.50 300 | $ 750.00
7134650 |BANANAS, PETITE 150CT $0.90 600 | $ 540.00 $2.50 600 | $ 1,500.00
7134600 |BANANAS 404 $0.90 1,200 | $ 1,080.00 $2.50 1,200 | $ 3,000.00
7134675 |CANTALOUPES 3 EACH $0.75 100 | $ 75.00 $1.25 100 | $ 125.00
7134800 |CANTALOUPES 15CT $0.90 400 | $ 360.00 $2.50 400 | $ 1,000.00
7136175 |GRAPEFRUIT, FANCY 40CT $0.90 200 | $ 180.00 $2.50 200 | $ 500.00
7135100 |GRAPES, RED SEEDLESS 18-23# $0.90 1,500 | $ 1,350.00 $2.50 1,500 | $ 3,750.00
7135125 |GRAPES, RED SEEDLESS S# $0.75 200 | $ 150.00 $1.25 200 | $ 250.00
7154400 |GRAPES, GREEN SEEDLESS 18-23# $0.90 1,500 | $ 1,350.00 $2.50 1,500 | $ 3,750.00
7154425 |GRAPES, GREEN SEEDLESS S# $0.75 200 | $ 150.00 $1.25 200 | $ 250.00
7135225 |HONEYDEWS 3 EACH $0.75 100 | $ 75.00 $1.25 100 | $ 125.00
7135200 |HONEYDEWS 8CT $0.90 400 | $ 360.00 $2.50 400 | $ 1,000.00
7135000 |KIWIFRUIT 39CT $0.90 700 | $ 630.00 $2.50 700 | $ 1,750.00
7135300 |LEMONS DOZEN $0.75 500 | $ 375.00 $1.75 500 | $ 875.00
7154950 |NECTARINES 72CT NO BID 1,000 | $ - $2.50 1,000 | $ 2,500.00
7135400 |ORANGES, NAVEL 125CT $0.90 1,500 | $ 1,350.00 $2.50 1,500 | $ 3,750.00
7154800 |PEACHES, MEDIUM 60CT $0.90 1,500 | $ 1,350.00 $2.50 1,500 | $ 3,750.00
7135600 |PEARS 140CT $0.90 1,000 | $ 900.00 $2.50 1,000 | $ 2,500.00
7135800 |PLUMS 28LB $0.90 1,000 | $ 900.00 $2.50 1,000 | $ 2,500.00
7135900 |STRAWBERRIES 8/1# $0.90 1,200 | $ 1,080.00 $2.50 1,200 | $ 3,000.00
7136000 |TANGERINES 120CT NO BID 1,600 $2.50 1,600 | $ 4,000.00
7136100 |WATERMELON 22-26LB $0.75 400 | $ 300.00 $2.50 400 | $ 1,000.00
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FRESH PRODUCE and EGGS 2024-2026
RFQ #24-164
JULY 18, 2024

NUTRITION SERVICES
BUDGET $1,000,000
PURCHASE AS NEEDED

RICHMOND COUNTY SCHOOL SYSTEM
FRESH PRODUCE & EGGS RFQ#24-164

Leo's Produce Inc.
1151 5th Street; Augusta, GA 30901

Royal Food Service
3720 Zip Industrial Blvd.; Atlanta, GA 30354

Item Description Vendor MARKUP/(MARKDOWN) Est. Estimated Total MARKUP/(MARKDOWN) Est. Estimated Total
FIXED FEE to FIXED FEE to
# Pack AVERAGE MARKET PRICE Usage | Markup/(Markdown) Fees AVERAGE MARKET PRICE Usage Markup/(Markdown) Fees
Category: PRODUCE AND FRESH EGGS
INDIVIDUALLY PACKAGED FRUIT
7144000 |APPLE WEDGES [100/207 $0.90 | 2,000 1,800.00 $2.50| 2,000 3 5,000.00
VEGETABLES
2128100 [CABBAGE, GREEN, 10-12 HEADS 50LB BAG $0.90 50 |$ 45.00 $2.50 50| $ 125.00
2128125 |CABBAGE, GREEN, HEAD 2 EACH $0.75 50 |$ 37.50 $1.25 50| $ 62.50
2128175 |CABBAGE, RED, MEDIUM 2 EACH $0.75 200 | $ 150.00 $1.25 200 | S 250.00
NEW CARROTS S5# $0.75 50| $ 37.50 $1.25 50 (S 62.50
12154200 |CARROTS 50# $0.90 50| $ 45.00 $2.50 50 (S 125.00
2127425 |CELERY 3 EACH $0.75 300 | S 225.00 $1.25 300 (S 375.00
12127400 |CELERY 30CT $0.90 50| $ 45.00 $2.50 50 (S 125.00
12128300 |CUCUMBERS, MEDIUM S# $0.75 1,000 | $ 750.00 $1.25 1,000 | $ 1,250.00
12130401 |LETTUCE, ROMAINE 3CT $0.75 1,200 | $ 900.00 $1.25 1,200 | $ 1,500.00
12 CT/HALF
12130400 |LETTUCE, ROMAINE CASE $0.75 500 | $ 375.00 $2.00 500 | $ 1,000.00
2130425 |[LETTUCE, LEAF, GREEN 3 EACH $0.75 50| $ 37.50 $1.25 50 (S 62.50
2130450 [LETTUCE, LEAF, GREEN 24 CT CASE $0.90 200 | S 180.00 $2.50 200 | S 500.00
2130475 |LETTUCE, LEAF, RED 3 EACH $0.75 50 |$ 37.50 $1.25 50 (S 62.50
2130485 |[LETTUCE, LEAF, RED 24 CT CASE $0.90 200 | $ 180.00 $2.50 200 | S 500.00
12046050 |LETTUCE, GEORGIA MIX GOURMET CASE $0.90 1,000 | $ 900.00 $2.50 1,000 | $ 2,500.00
2130495 |[MUSHROOMS, FANCY, MEDIUM 3 $0.75 100 | $ 75.00 $1.25 100 | $ 125.00
12154900 |ONIONS, GREEN 6CT $0.75 100 | $ 75.00 $1.25 100 | $ 125.00
12129000 |ONIONS, JUMBO YELLOW S# $0.75 250 | $ 187.50 $1.25 250 | S 312.50
12128800 |ONIONS, JUMBO YELLOW 25# $0.75 400 | $ 300.00 $2.50 400 | $ 1,000.00
12124950 |ONIONS, JUMBO RED S5# $0.75 200 | $ 150.00 $1.25 200 | S 250.00
12129700 |PARSLEY, BUNCH EACH $0.75 25| S 18.75 $1.25 251S 31.25
12128900 |PEPPERS, GREEN 5# $0.75 100 | $ 75.00 $1.25 100 | $ 125.00
12129200 |POTATOES, BAKING 100 CT $0.90 1,000 | $ 900.00 $2.50 1,000 | $ 2,500.00
12127601 |POTATOES, SWEET 90 CT $0.90 700 | $ 630.00 $2.50 700 | S 1,750.00
12136200 |SPINACH, TRIPLE WASHED 2.5# BAG $0.75 200 | $ 150.00 $1.25 200 | S 250.00
12136600 |SPINACH, TRIPLE WASHED 4/2.5# BAGS $0.90 200 | $ 180.00 $2.50 200 | S 500.00
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FRESH PRODUCE and EGGS 2024-2026
RFQ #24-164
JULY 18, 2024

NUTRITION SERVICES
BUDGET $1,000,000
PURCHASE AS NEEDED

RICHMOND COUNTY SCHOOL SYSTEM
FRESH PRODUCE & EGGS RFQ#24-164

Leo's Produce Inc.

1151 5th Street; Augusta, GA 30901

Royal Food Service

3720 Zip Industrial Blvd.; Atlanta, GA 30354

Item Description Vendor MARKUP/(MARKDOWN) Est. Estimated Total MARKUP/(MARKDOWN) Est. Estimated Total
FIXED FEE to FIXED FEE to
# Pack AVERAGE MARKET PRICE Usage | Markup/(Markdown) Fees AVERAGE MARKET PRICE Usage Markup/(Markdown) Fees
Category: PRODUCE AND FRESH EGGS
VEGETABLES (CONTINUED)
12137500 |SQUASH, SUMMER, YELLOW S# $0.75 50 | $ 37.50 $1.25 50 |$ 62.50
12138100 |SQUASH, ZUCCHINI S# $0.75 100 | $ 75.00 $1.25 100 | $ 125.00
7129900 |TOMATOES, GRAPE 12 PT FLAT $0.90 750 | $ 675.00 $2.50 750 | $ 1,875.00
7129800 |TOMATOES, CHERRY 12 PT FLAT $0.90 750 | $ 675.00 $2.50 750 | $ 1,875.00
12132600 | TOMATOES, LARGE 25# BOX $0.90 2,500 | $ 2,250.00 $2.50 2,500 | $ 6,250.00
12132601 |TOMATOES, LARGE 5# BOX $0.75 250 | $ 187.50 $1.25 250 | $ 312.50
12129700 |TOMATOES, ROMA 25# $0.90 500 | $ 450.00 $2.50 500 | $ 1,250.00
PRE-CUT VEGETABLES: All pre-cut vegetables must contain no preservatives and be 100% useable, heat sealed bags, no tipper tie
2154150 |BROCCOLI FLORETS 3# BAG $0.75 100 | $ 75.00 $1.25 100 | $ 125.00
12154100 |BROCCOLI FLORETS 4/3# BAG $0.90 200 | $ 180.00 $2.50 200 | $ 500.00
12122300 |SLAW, DRY MIX 5# BAG $0.75 500 | $ 375.00 $1.25 500 | $ 625.00
12129900 |SLAW, DRY MIX 4/5# BAGS $0.90 200 | $ 180.00 $2.50 200 | $ 500.00
212797925|CARROTS, BABY 5# BAG $0.75 100 | $ 75.00 $1.25 100 | $ 125.00
12127900 |CARROTS, BABY 4/5# BAGS $0.90 1,500 | $ 1,350.00 $2.50 1,500 | $ 3,750.00
12127950 |[CARROTS, SHREDDED S5# BAG $0.75 100 | $ 75.00 $1.25 100 | $ 125.00
12127500 |CARROT STICKS S#BAG $0.75 750 | $ 562.50 $1.25 750 | $ 937.50
12127750 |CARROT STICKS 4/5#BAG $0.90 1,000 | $ 900.00 $2.50 1,000 | $ 2,500.00
2131250 |CAULIFLOWER FLORETS 3# BAG $0.75 50| $ 37.50 $1.25 50 [ $ 62.50
12131200 |CAULIFLOWER FLORETS 4/3# BAGS $0.90 50| S 45.00 $2.50 50| $ 125.00
12127100 |CELERY STICKS S5# BAG $0.75 1,000 | $ 750.00 $1.25 1,000 | $ 1,250.00
12127300 |CELERY STICKS 4/5# BAGS $0.90 1,000 | $ 900.00 $2.50 1,000 | $ 2,500.00
12137800 |COLLARDS, CHOPPED 6/2# BAGS $0.90 250 | S 225.00 $2.50 250 | S 625.00
12122000 [LETTUCE, SHREDDED S5# BAG $0.75 800 | $ 600.00 $1.25 800 | S 1,000.00
12128500 |LETTUCE, SHREDDED 4/5# BAGS $0.90 200 | $ 180.00 $2.50 200 | $ 500.00
2141800 |PEPPERS, RED, WHOLE S# $0.75 1,000 | $ 750.00 $1.25 1,000 | $ 1,250.00
NEW  |PEPPERS, YELLOW, WHOLE S# $0.75 500 | $ 375.00 $1.25 500 | $ 625.00
2140825 |TURNIP GREENS, CHOPPED 6/2# $0.90 200 | $ 180.00 $2.50 200 | $ 500.00
EGGS
EGGS, LARGE DOZEN $0.75 100 | $ 75.00 $1.25 100 | $ 125.00
EGGS, LARGE 15 DOZEN $0.75 200 | $ 150.00 $2.50 200 | $ 500.00
EGGS, LARGE 30 DOZEN $0.90 50 | $ 45.00 $2.50 50 |$ 125.00

30F3




